RBA Inc. (DBA Phoenix
CMP Distributors, Inc. Proforce Marketing, Inc. Vance Outdoors, Inc. Distributors)
Total Price for Total Price for Total Price for Total Price for
Estimated Estimated Estimated Estimated
Quantity Item Description -Purchase Unit Price Quantity Unit Price Quantity Unit Price Quantity Unit Price Quantity
New Mossberg 590A1 12ga Shotguns. 18.5” Barrel, 6+1
36 Clean Out Tube, Ghost Ring Sights, Parkerized Finish, $525.00 $18,900.00] $491.83 $17,709.48] $497.40 $17,906.40 $575.00 $20,700.00
Synthetic M-LOK Forend, Model #50765
g6 |Hogue Orange Less Lethal Stock Set. (Stock & Forend) $62.50 $2,250.00 $57.75 $2,079.00| $44.50 $1,602.00 $62.00 $2,232.00
Model 05042.
New Colt Commando .223/5.56 Caliber Rifles, 11.5”
Barrel, Semi/Safe/Full Auto, 4-Position Collapsible Stock, . .
6 Detachable Carry Handle Or Magpul MBUS Flip Up Rear $1,485.00 $8,910.00] $1,023.54 $6,141.24 No Bid No Bid} $1,100.00 $6,600.00
Sight, W/1-30rd Magpul Magazine. Model R0933.
New Colt Carbine .223/5.56 Caliber Rifles, 16.1” Step
Cut Barrel, Semi/Safe Only, 4-Position Collapsible Stock, . .
30 Magpul MBUS Flip Up Rear Sight, W/1-30rd Magpul $999.00 $29,970.00 $820.12 $24,603.60 No Bid No Bid} $875.00 $26,250.00
Magazine. Model CR6920.
Quantity Item Description -Trade In
Used Remington 18” Model 870 12ga Shotgun W/Less
36 Lethal Stock & Forend $165.00 $5,940.00) $205.00 $7,380.00| $100.00 $3,600.00 $275.00 $9,900.00
4 Used S&W 18” M3000 12ga Shotguns $150.00 $600.00 $145.00 $580.00| $100.00 $400.00 $125.00 $500.00
4 Used Benelli 14” M1 Super 90 12ga Shotguns $225.00 $900.00 $405.00 $1,620.00| $200.00 $800.00 $400.00 $1,600.00
g |Used Colt M16A2 Commando Rifles WiDetachable Carry No Bid No Bid| $301.00 $1,806.00 $200.00 $1,200.00 $450.00 $2,700.00
Handle & 1-Magazine
24 :\J/If;ag‘;g LE M4 Rifles W/16.1" Step Cut Barrel &1- $300.00 $7,200.00 $465.00 $11,160.00| $350.00 $8,400.00 $775.00 $18,600.00
10 Used Armor Express Ballistic Vests No Bid No BidI $20.00 $200.00| No Bid No BidI $25.00 $250.00
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