Bid Tabulation for Environmental Laboratory Testing Services
Opened by City Clerk on Tuesday, June 6, 2023 at 11:00am

Eurofins Environment Testing

Trace Analytical Laboratories,

North Central, LLC Prein&Newhof Inc
Standard Standard Standard

Per Test Cost Turnaround Time Per Test Cost Turnaround Time Per Test Cost Turnaround Time
Drinking Water Analysis
Total Organic Carbon (TOC) $50.00 10 business days $15.00 5-7 business days $28.00 10 business days
Gross Alpha (Rad) $90.00 10 business days No Bid No Bid
Radium 226 & 228 $230.00 10 business days No Bid No Bid
Total Trihalomethane (TTHM) $115.00 10 business days $60.00 5-7 business days $85.00 10 business days
Haloacetic Acids (HAAS) $170.00 10 business days $130.00 5-7 business days $150.00 10 business days
SOC - Carbamates $165.00 10 business days No Bid No Bid
SOC - Herbicides $210.00 10 business days No Bid No Bid
SOC - Pesticides $100.00 10 business days No Bid No Bid
VOC $160.00 10 business days $100.00 5-7 business days $78.00 10 business days
PFAS $285.00 10 business days $350.00 14 business days No Bid
Cyanide $40.00 10 business days $25.00 5-7 business days $26.00 10 business days
Fluoride $30.00 10 business days $15.00 5-7 business days $12.00 10 business days
Nitrite $35.00 10 business days $15.00 5-7 business days $12.00 10 business days
Nitrate Included with Nitrite | 10 business days $15.00 5-7 business days $12.00 10 business days
Sodium $25.00 10 business days $25.00 5-7 business days $6.00 10 business days
Sulfate $40.00 10 business days $15.00 5-7 business days $12.00 10 business days
Lead and Copper $30.00 10 business days $18.00 5-7 business days $26.00 10 business days
Total Metals (Sb, As, Ba, Be, Cd, Cr, Pb, Ni, Se, $97.00 10 business days $150.00 5-7 business days $104.00 10 business days




Bid Tabulation for Environmental Laboratory Testing Services

Opened by City Clerk on Tuesday, June 6, 2023 at 11:00am

Eurofins Environment Testing

Trace Analytical Laboratories,

North Central, LLC Prein&Newhof Inc
Standard Standard Standard
Wastewater (NPDES) Analysis Per Test Cost Turnaround Time Per Test Cost Turnaround Time Per Test Cost Turnaround Time
Low Level Mercury $110.00 10 business days No Bid $60.00 10 business days
PFAS $265.00 20 business days $450.00 14 business days No Bid
Included with Base

Acid-Extractable Compounds $155.00 10 business days No Bid Neutral 10 business days
Base-neutral Compounds $360.00 10 business days No Bid $150.00 10 business days
VOC $70.00 10 business days $100.00 5-7 business days $60.00 10 business days
Cyanide - Total $28.00 10 business days $25.00 5-7 business days $26.80 10 business days
Cyanide - Available $90.00 10 business days No Bid $60.00 10 business days
HEM/SGT-HEM $60.00 10 business days $45.00 5-7 business days $40.00 10 business days
Total Recoverable Metals (Sb, Ag, As, Be, Cd,
Cr, Cu, Pb, Ni, Se, Tl, Zn) $80.00 10 business days $150.00 5-7 business days $72.00 10 business days
Whole Effluent Toxicity - Acute and Chronic No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total Phenolic Compounds $30.00 10 business days $25.00 5-7 business days $50.00 10 business days
Hardness $40.00 10 business days $15.00 5-7 business days $12.00 10 business days

Eurofins Environment Testing ) Trace Analytical Laboratories,

Prein&Newhof
North Central, LLC Inc
. . Per Test Cost Standard . Per Test Cost Standard . Per Test Cost Standard .

Industrial Wastewater Analysis Turnaround Time Turnaround Time Turnaround Time
Mercury $25.00 10 business days $40.00 5-7 business days $20.00 10 business days
PFAS $265.00 20 business days $450.00 14 business days No Bid
SVoC $155.00 10 business days $150.00 5-7 business days $150.00 10 business days
VvOC $70.00 10 business days $100.00 5-7 business days $60.00 10 business days
Cyanide - Total $28.00 10 business days $25.00 5-7 business days $26.80 10 business days
Cyanide - Amenable $28.00 10 business days No Bid $40.00 10 business days
HEM/SGT-HEM $60.00 10 business days $45.00 5-7 business days $40.00 10 business days
Total Recoverable Metals (Sb, Ag, As, Be, Cd,
Cr, Cu, Pb, Ni, Se, Tl, Zn, Sn, Co) $80.00 10 business days $150.00 5-7 business days $84.00 10 business days




Bid Tabulation for Environmental Laboratory Testing Services

Opened by City Clerk on Tuesday, June 6, 2023 at 11:00am

Eurofins Environment Testing

Trace Analytical Laboratories,

North Central, LLC Prein&Newhof Inc
Standard Standard Standard

Biosolids Analysis Per Test Cost Turnaround Time Per Test Cost Turnaround Time Per Test Cost Turnaround Time
VOC $70.00 10 business days $100.00 5-7 business days $60.00 10 business days
SOC $160.00 10 business days No Bid $150.00 10 business days
Nitrate $40.00 10 business days $15.00 5-7 business days $13.31 10 business days
Nitrite Included with Nitrate| 10 business days $15.00 5-7 business days $13.31 10 business days
Sulfate $20.00 10 business days $15.00 5-7 business days $13.31 10 business days
% Moisture $2.50 10 business days No Charge 5-7 business days $7.25 10 business days
Mercury $25.00 10 business days $40.00 5-7 business days $20.00 10 business days
Total Recoverable Metals (Sb, Ag, As, Be, Cd,
Cr, Cu, Pb, Ni, Se, Tl, Zn, Ca, Mg, K) $105.00 10 business days $150.00 5-7 business days $90.00 10 business days
TKN $33.00 10 business days $30.00 5-7 business days $29.40 10 business days

Eurofins Environment Testing ) Trace Analytical Laboratories,

Prein&Newhof

North Central, LLC

Inc

Other Fees and Charges

$5.00 per sample Safe and
Environmentally Responsible Waste
Management Fee

None

$12 per invoice Environmental
Responsibility Fee

Courier Service (container delivery and
sample pickup at Wyoming facilities)

No Charge

$25 per trip for Clean Water Plant $50

per trip for Water Treatment Plant

No Charge

DMRAQA Participation Charge

No Charge

No Charge

No Charge

Upcharge for Rush Turnaround Time

1 bus. day = +100%; 2 bus. Day = +75%; 3
bus. Day = +60%; 4 bus. Day = +45%; 5 bus.
Day = +30% (PFAS priced separately and
subjet to lab availability)

Next Day = +100% (not all tests available);
2 day = +80%; 3 day = +60%;

2 Business Days = +100%; 3-4 Business
Days =+50%




